
Welcome	to	Wallsburg	Girls	Camp	
	

---	PLEASE	READ	THIS	BEFORE	MAKING	A	RESERVATION!	---	

The primary purpose of the Wallsburg Girls Camp is to provide outdoor 
experiences for young women that will promote their spiritual, social, and 
cultural development.  We accommodate young women camps during the 
summer weekdays, Monday through Friday mornings.  Church groups and 
families that meet church standards of conduct may also reserve the facility 
for the remaining open calendar days.  There is no Sunday camping.  

Exclusive use of the pavilion facilities (kitchen, bathrooms, showers) can only 
be guaranteed if that entire camp is reserved. If groups share the pavilions, 
the group leaders will want to meet and coordinate usage and cleaning.   

CAMP DESCRIPTION 

The Wallsburg Girls Camp is a scenic property located 60 miles Southeast of 
Salt Lake City and 4 miles Southeast of the town of Wallsburg. The camp is 
located on 93 acres of beautiful Maple, Oak, Cottonwood, and Willow trees. 
The camp has several grassy areas for activities and a cool year-round 
stream winding through the property. 

There are two large campgrounds (Oak and Legacy) and a smaller camp 
(Maple) that include many excellent camping areas with leveled tent sites and 
limited RV parking.  Each camp has a large pavilion with kitchens, 
refrigerators, propane camp stoves (propane provided), and metal picnic 
tables.  All camps have easy access to culinary water, limited electricity, 
flushing toilets, showers, fire pits, and an amphitheater (sound systems are 
available to check out).   



The camps are also in close proximity to the Challenge Course, Archery 
Range, Human Foosball, the large activity field (equipment for various games 
available for checkout), and a variety of marked scenic hikes with varying 
degrees of length and difficulty. 

Oak and Legacy camps can each facilitate a large group (stake size / about 
160-185) and Maple can accommodate one smaller group (ward or family size 
/ about 60). Wallsburg Girls Camp has a total capacity of about 400 occupants 
at a time and can be scheduled through the LDS Camp Web Site 
(camping.lds.org).  

Reading through the Wallsburg Camp Rules before arriving on site will answer 
many of your questions and help facilitate a pleasant camping experience.  
Wallsburg Girls Camp has two Camp Host Missionary Couples whose 
purpose is to make your stay as stress-free and enjoyable as possible.    

STANDARDS OF CONDUCT 

Church standards must be maintained by all users and enforced by 
group leaders.  These standards are outlined in the “For the Strength of 
Youth” booklet and include the restriction of alcohol, tobacco, and illicit drugs 
use, church dress standards, and the avoidance of any conduct that would be 
contrary to an uplifting environment.    

Remember 
Camp Changes Girls 


